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Introduction 
 
When wars end, armed forces are generally downsized and armed groups disbanded, as signs that 
peace has come but also because of the costs of maintaining militaries. For the individuals 
concerned, this implies a major change in life. Beginning in the late 1980s, external actors began 
to take a keen interest in promoting post-conflict downsizing of forces and reintegration of 
individuals into civilian society as an instrument of post-conflict peacebuilding.i Disarmament, 
demobilisation and reintegration (DDR)ii has become the preferred shorthand term for packages 
of activities combining force downsizing and reintegration of former combatants into civil 
society, including a host of measures such as the collection of combatants in camps, their 
registration and discharge, generally in exchange for the surrender of weapons, and support for 
their start in civilian occupations. The latter can include transport to home locations, a series of 
cash payments, training and micro-credit schemes. While often organisationally separated, 
support for the reintegration of former combatants in society is nonetheless regularly included in 
the package, because it increases the likelihood of success of the programme, and, for the 
individual combatant, is the most important aspect. DDR has become part of the core repertoire 
of post-war donor reconstruction assistance and is rightly seen as a central element for the long-
term peacebuilding process. What is often overlooked, however, is that DDR has security 
implications beyond the cessation of hostilities among warring parties and influences the 
conditions for security sector reconstruction and reform (SSR). 

It will be argued here that a number of deficiencies, inconsistencies, contradictions, but 
predominantly losses of potential synergies mark the relationship between efforts at SSR and the 
policies and practices of DDR. More coordination between SSR on the one hand and DDR on the 
other hand would be cost-saving, beneficial for individuals concerned, and would enhance the 
functioning of armed and police forces. The main place for such coordination of efforts are joint 
military-civilian institutions of security sector governance. The argument is made here on the 
basis of a review of the relevant literature. Unfortunately, rather little thought has been given to 
the analysis of the links between SSR and DDR so far, and empirical evidence is scant. 

Still, it seems that various factors are responsible for the unsatisfactory relationship 
between SSR and DDR, described in some depth below. One is conceptual differences. The 
purposes of SSR have been fairly clearly defined: the creation of effective, accountable forces 
and supporting structures to bring security to people. The goals of DDR programmes, on the other 
hand, are rather case-dependent, and range from simple downsizing and cost-cutting to a central 
role in peacebuilding. The wide range of objectives of DDR programmes reflects a broad 
spectrum of purpose in actual DDR programmes. The second discrepancy between DDR and SSR 
is notable in comparing the practice of DDR and SSR. Ironically, the conceptual contrast between 
DDR and SSR is turned upside-down when one looks at implementation. DDR consists of a set of 
fairly clear and standard procedures with some variety to cater to the particular case. Still, DDR 
programmes, of which there have by now been quite a large number in many countries, look 
rather similar all over the world. The prescribed programme for SSR on the other hand is vast, 
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and consists of many elements, including, in many cases, DDR. Practical applications of more 
than a few of these elements are, so far, few to note. A third important difference accounting for 
much of the tension between SSR and DDR are the main actors involved. SSR, within a 
framework of democratic security sector governance, is predominantly a process steered by 
domestic political actors, governmental and non-governmental, and specialists in public security 
institutions, although increasingly also including private actors.iii Development donors have also 
discovered SSR as a field of activity, but so far remain of secondary importance. DDR, on the 
other hand, involves a more limited set of actors. After the initial decisions on the extent and the 
character of downsizing has been made by political decisionmakers, the main actors of DDR are 
technical experts, generally military experts for the ‘DD’ and development experts, with a 
dominant influence of external development actors, for the ‘R’. The overlap of actors in DDR and 
SSR is largest in peace support operations, where the security sector needs to be reconstructed or 
newly established. With the UN increasingly covering this task, its offices and organisations have 
taken on responsibilities for both SSR and DDR. Most of the available discussion on the links 
between SSR and DDR has accordingly been conducted within the larger debate on the 
integration and expansion of UN peace support operations.iv 

The differences in concepts and practice, as well as on the level of primary actors, between 
SSR and DDR lead first and foremost to a delinking of what in fact are linked issues, as is argued 
below. Furthermore, this delinking can even lead to tensions between SSR and DDR. In both 
cases, the outcome is suboptimal for both policy arenas. SSR and DDR have many overlaps 
which are often unexploited, because of lack of coordination but also by choice of the main 
actors. The overlaps occur because SSR and DDR concern, in principle, the same organisations, 
in particular the military but also the police and other security forces, as well as overlapping 
groups of people. But the interests in SSR and DDR differ, which is reflected in the above 
mentioned range of objectives in DDR and practices in SSR. 

This chapter looks at how SSR has been linked to DDR and vice versa, focusing on post-
conflict situations, the most dramatic theatres for downsizing and reintegration measures, and 
changes in security sector institutions. Often in civil wars, DDR is part of the peace negotiation 
package. The need to reduce the costs of armed forces also provides powerful pressure for 
downsizing in all cases where wars have come to an end. Still, some DDR programmes have 
occurred several years after the end of fighting. The main reasons for this delayed downsizing of 
armed forces are the reluctance of former warring parties to agree to major force reductions soon 
after the conflict, and the time it takes to organise international financial support for reintegration 
measures. As time goes by, DDR, even if occurring in post-conflict situations, becomes more 
similar to downsizing in countries motivated primarily by financial considerations or the wish to 
modernise their forces.  

Special emphasis is given throughout this chapter to security sector governance concerns. 
The proper place to link the approaches to SSR and DDR are security sector governance 
institutions. In order to be able to provide guidance to both SSR and DDR, these institutions need 
to include stakeholders in both SSR and DDR. The concluding section offers suggestions for 
improving the relation between SSR and DDR through better security governance, discussing 
both opportunities but also limitations of such an approach.  

 
 

DDR in Post-Conflict Settings 
 
While the combination of post-war demobilisation and support to ex-combatants is nothing new, 
it had not been a noticeable feature of post-war situations in developing countries until the late 
1980s, when international development donors as well as peacekeepers became interested in 
supporting such programmes. The first United Nations peacekeeping operation to undertake 
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disarmament and demobilisation was the United Nations Observer Group in Central America 
(ONUCA), which was deployed in 1989. 

The primary motivation for DDR programmes in post-conflict situations has been and 
continues to be a contribution to peacebuilding. In the words of the Brahimi Report of August 
2000 on the reform of peacekeeping, DDR is a ‘key to immediate post-conflict stability and 
reduced likelihood of conflict recurrence’. It is called ‘an area in which peacebuilding makes a 
direct contribution to public security and law and order’.v In a report by the UN Secretary General 
on The Role of United Nations Peacekeeping in Disarmament, Demobilisation and Reintegration, 
published in 2000, it is said: ‘In the civil conflicts of the post-cold war era, a process of 
disarmament, demobilisation and reintegration has repeatedly proved to be vital to stabilising a 
post-conflict situation; to reducing the likelihood of renewed violence, either because of relapse 
into war or outbreaks of banditry; and to facilitating a society’s transition from conflict to 
normalcy and development.’vi Development donors argue similarly. The World Bank, for 
instance, starts the internet presentation of its activities on DDR with the following observations: 
‘The prospects for stabilisation and recovery in conflict-affected countries largely depend on the 
success of the disarmament, demobilisation and reintegration (DDR) process.’vii  

The argumentation in these and other official documents on DDR is based on a narrow 
perception of post-conflict security. Security is primarily seen as an issue of making peace 
between the former warring parties. If one side wins, it is seen as natural that the soldiers of the 
losing side will be demobilised. In addition, the winning party should also be able to reduce the 
number of its combatants. If there is no winner on the battlefield, but there is the political will to 
stop fighting, the future of security institutions, particularly the various forces which have fought 
the war, needs to be negotiated. 

Putting peace first is good policy in post-conflict situations. However, the legitimate 
priority of satisfying the security concerns of former foes is not the only security consideration 
that should inform decisionmaking even early in a post-war situation. Parties which have fought 
in a war will not be the only relevant groups of people in need of improvements in security. The 
marginalisation of other groups in post-war situations at the expense of those involved in war-
fighting, and thus peace-making, has been a major problem in a number of post-war situations, in 
some cases, such as Sudan  after 2004, directly leading to renewed conflict. Moreover, in most 
post-conflict situations, the protection of people’s lives and rights is generally at a very low level. 
The monopoly of force often needs to be reestablished and security provision improved. This is 
an interest beyond the immediate one for peace. Unfortunately, in many countries, the ending of 
immediate fighting has not led to a rapid improvement of physical security of people – for some 
cases, such as El Salvador in the mid-1990s, it is even claimed that individual physical security 
declined after the end of the war.viii  

In addition to its contribution to peace, the effects of DDR on post-war security, including 
efforts at security sector reconstruction and reform, are therefore of interest. Two issues stand out. 
The first is familiar in the DDR literature and concerns the ‘demand’ for security, or put 
differently, the insecurity in a post-conflict situation. The other is often overlooked, including in 
the documents quoted above; and is about the way in which DDR programmes themselves are 
shaping the ‘supply’ of security, or put differently, the operation of security sector institutions. 
 
Failed Reintegration as a Source of Insecurity 
 
There is general agreement in the DDR literature that reintegration success has direct effects on 
post-war security. First, there is the immediate effect of satisfying fighting factions and their 
members, who often see themselves as entitled to some benefits. Lack of satisfaction with 
reintegration can lead to internal unrest, such as in Nicaragua in the mid-1990s, and Zimbabwe in 
the late 1990s. However, a more frequent effect of low levels of integration of former combatants 
into the regular economy is an increase in criminal activity. The danger of former combatants 
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using their skills as ‘violence entrepreneurs’ is frequently mentioned in DDR discourse: 
‘reintegration – or the lack thereof – will affect levels of crime and instability in the longer run.’ix 

Additionally, there can be international security effects. In the West African case, there are 
reports that soldiers demobilised, but not reintegrated, in Liberia were easy prey for warlords who 
wanted to attract fighters for the war in Côte d’Ivoire.x To the extent that unsuccessful 
reintegration contributes to high rates of criminality, it also adds to the demand for police, courts 
and prisons. Another repercussion is that former combatants have, in several cases, such as 
Nicaragua and Zimbabwe, organised politically and extracted additional funds from the 
government, with the argument that they had not been sufficiently rewarded. 

For most former combatants, the main aspect of civilian integration is to find gainful 
employment or some other way to earn an income. Obviously, this is primarily an economic 
issue. In many countries, domestic economic actors and external donors are primarily called upon 
to support former combatants to find a place in civilian society. But defence and military planners 
also exert some influence over the forms and costs of civilian economic reintegration by deciding 
on numbers and types of positions to be cut. Military organisations can also help make the step 
from military to civilian life easier by providing combatants with qualifications which are useful 
in civilian life.xi  

Observers of recent DDR processes agree that reintegration is the most difficult part of 
programmes, but also the least likely to be adequately funded. Comparatively large amounts of 
money are often programmed for reintegration support, but even when these sums can be found, 
they may not suffice. In addition, funds for reintegration of former combatants usually come from 
development assistance budgets in donor countries which often means they are slow to flow. As a 
result, many of the recent DDR processes have seen serious underfunding of the reintegration 
component. A recent example is the Liberian case, where the number of people to be reintegrated 
is much higher than initially planned and budgeted for, and where resources are slow in coming 
into the country. In early March 2005, the total number of formally demobilised combatants stood 
at 101,495, including 22,370 women, 8,523 boys and 2,440 girls, while the number of ex-
combatants in reintegration projects was only 25,591. Projects for a further 44,502 ex-combatants 
were in the pipeline but many of these projects had yet to commence owing to a lack of funding.xii 

While most recent DDR processes have occurred fairly quickly after the end of conflict, in 
some cases downsizing occurred only after some years, either because of security concerns or out 
of consideration for the people earning an income in armed forces.xiii In such cases, the task of 
preparing soldiers for civilian life is often picked up by armed forces. There are three arguments 
in favour of involvement by defence and military institutions in preparing combatants for 
reintegration. The first is that in many cases it is simply more practical, if implementation of 
measures which facilitate the integration of former armed forces personnel occurs within the 
armed forces. People are already registered, their qualification profiles and deficiencies known 
etc. Measures can be spread over a longer period, with counselling and training accumulating 
towards the end of military careers. The second reason is the effect on job satisfaction when 
soldiers know that their institution is preparing its members for a later civilian life. The final, and 
most important, reason is that unsuccessful reintegration can have major security implications. 
Security sector organisations are thus doing themselves a favour by helping soldiers to prepare for 
civilian life. 
 
SSR Parameter Setting through DDR Programmes 
 
While the effects of DDR programmes on security, which can only briefly be summarised here, 
are accepted in the DDR literature, there is much less recognition of the way in which DDR 
programmes influence security sector reconstruction and reform. DDR is often seen as a rather 
technical process, while in fact, it often is, in addition, a highly political one.xiv In particular, 
decisionmaking on the overall numbers of combatants to be demobilised as well as on who will 
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be kept on in security forces and who will be demobilised set important parameters for security 
sector reconstruction and reform. In official documents on DDR, such as the ones quoted above, 
these decision are seen as outside of the realm of DDR programmes, coming out of the 
negotiations of the warring parties, from the winning side or whomever is running the show. 
While such an approach may be acceptable for DDR implementers, it is inappropriate for 
organisations involved in DDR policy-making, planning and funding. However, many 
organisations, including the UN DPKO and the World Bank, have a hard time acknowledging this 
link between DDR and SSR.  

Somewhat unrealistically, it seems to be implied in such documents that warring parties 
will make the right decisions about numbers, and retain only those forces necessary for future 
security maintenance and shed the rest. Obviously, however, warring parties and their leaders 
have additional interests in decisionmaking on numbers. They want to reward their fighters and 
protect their interests, as well as not give up power positions in the future political process, which 
will partly be based on the satisfaction of former fighters and their families with the DDR 
process. The logical result of this interest is that larger numbers of people are kept in armed 
forces than would be necessary for the maintenance of post-war security. One good example of 
this is Bosnia. The force numbers agreed in the wake of the Dayton Peace agreement are 
ridiculously high, considering that security in the country was to be provided by international 
peacekeepers. The leaders of the warring parties convinced the international community to accept 
these numbers as a confidence-building measure, but obviously this also provided them with a 
means to reward former combatants. There have been successive rounds of downsizing  after the 
Dayton agreement, but this was largely on the insistence of external donors who funded a large 
part of the oversized forces.  

Contrary to the impression given in many official documents, however, the international 
community has much influence on decisionmaking over numbers. The main leverage of the 
international community is money. In most conflict situations, substantial portions of the costs of 
domestic security forces, such as the military and police, have to be covered by bilateral donors. 
These obviously have an interest in reducing such costs as much as possible, offsetting to some 
extent the interests of warring parties to keep large numbers of troops. 

Another factor shaping the framework for SSR are decisions on major personnel 
parameters of demobilisation. Decisions on who to demobilise and who to keep in the armed 
forces is, judging by official documents, largely a decision of the warring parties. There are some 
exceptions. The international community is very concerned about child recruitment and will 
therefore insist on demobilisation of all underage persons within armed groups. Similarly, the 
international community is concerned that special care is taken of some groups, such as female 
combatants, the handicapped, and people with trauma. But beyond that, the generally accepted 
starting point of DDR processes is that those agreeing on the terms of a peace agreement should 
decide. While it seems wise to leave decisions on the integration of forces, whom to keep on and 
whom not and so on, with the former warring parties from the point of view of peacebuilding, it is 
problematic from the point of view of creating and maintaining efficient and democratically 
controlled security institutions.  

Predictably, leaders of warring parties will decide to keep those persons who are most loyal 
and most able, to whom they are most indebted and who will be troublesome if they feel ill-
treated by their leaders. They will want to get rid of troublemakers, sick people and the 
handicapped. Long-serving soldiers and officers will more likely choose to stay in the armed 
forces than young recruits, because they will have higher merits and also would find it more 
difficult to reintegrate into civilian life. The likely result of decisionmaking on personnel 
parameters of demobilisation are first, a more efficient, and second, a more loyal, force after 
demobilisation.  

It should be obvious from the above that DDR programmes are also defence reform 
projects where the decisions on who to demobilise and who to keep on are made by leaders of 
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warring parties. However, they are generally defence reform projects from above, in the interests 
of leaders of former fighting groups, and with little discussion about them. One good example of 
this was the DDR process in Sierra Leone in the early 2000s. Prior to the peace negotiations, a 
force of 5,000 soldiers was recommended in a study by ECOMOG. In the Lomé Peace 
Agreement of 1999 it was agreed that the ex-combatants of the three major fighting forces ‘who 
wish to be integrated into the new restructured national armed forces may do so provided they 
meet established criteria’ (Article VII). After a lengthy DDR process, during which more than 
72,000 persons were formally demobilised, the Sierra Leone armed forces have a strength of 
14,500 solders.xv 

The international community has been somewhat slow to grasp these realities. In early 
DDR programmes they were ignored. In the Ugandan demobilisation programme of the early 
1990s, for instance, many of the demobilised were HIV-infected, had disabilities, or were 
otherwise unfit for military service. It can well be argued that the international community, by 
subsidising the reintegration of these former soldiers, inadvertently paid for an increase in the 
efficiency of the Ugandan armed forces (but also for the spreading of HIV in the countryside 
where former soldiers settled after demobilisation). As it turned out, the Ugandan government 
later increased personnel numbers again, justifying this with the volatile situation in the Eastern 
DRC. In retrospect, the international development community had thus helped the Ugandan 
armed forces to modernise.  

DDR programmes also have an influence on SSR by adding to the supply of people with 
certain types of skills. Former soldiers generally have at least some qualifications such as 
working in very regulated environments but also in dangerous situations, or the application of 
physical violence and weapons handling, that raise their competitiveness for positions in other 
parts of the security sector. When former combatants or regular soldiers look for civilian 
occupations, jobs in the security sector are one interesting alternative. However, the experience 
with employing former military personnel in police forces has been mixed. Two major cases of 
failure are Haiti and El Salvador.xvi The main reasons for failure were insufficient screening of 
applicants for police service and insufficient training of police recruits. This resulted in police 
forces more familiar with military than with police methods of dealing with problems and with 
large numbers of members involved in earlier war crimes. In both cases, police forces largely 
recruited from among former combatants had to be dissolved and new recruitment drives started. 
Qualifications needed by members of police forces are only partially consistent with military 
qualifications. Dependent on the type and organisation of police force, independence, knowledge 
of the law and communication skills are of overriding importance. These are generally not the 
skills learned in armed forces. Planning for soldiers to become police officers needs to be 
carefully done. The interest of a professional police force should be primary, with recruitment of 
former soldiers following this lead. Again, communication among those planning DDR and those 
planning police reconstruction and reform is central, and is best done within institutions of 
security sector governance.  

Another part of the security sector often absorbing former combatants and ex-soldiers are 
private military and security companies. The private security industry has become an important, 
though still deficient, field of security sector governance.xvii The role of former armed forces 
personnel has not received special attention so far, although there would be some options, such as 
requiring former members of national armed forces to register prior to working for foreign 
military companies.  
 
Linking DDR with SSR in Post-Conflict Settings 
 
Peace agreements differ widely with respect to the scope of future security arrangements 
contained in their texts. In general, the focus is justifiably on the avoidance of the recurrence of 
fighting among the peace-making parties. One such example is the Dayton agreement with its 
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provisions on arms reduction and confidence-building measures. Other agreements have, 
however, had additional provisions, for instance on the recruitment, composition and objectives 
of police forces, or on elements of the rule of law, such as the division of responsibilities within 
federalist systems.  

Still, it is safe to say that the provision of physical security of individuals from crime and 
violence has been of lesser concern to peace-makers, including when deciding on DDR 
programmes. Ways in which such links could have been made are, for instance, decisions on the 
composition of the security sector, the objectives of the various forces etc. Demobilisation could 
be used in these circumstances as an instrument to shape the conditions for the provision of 
security to individuals, that is human security, in post-conflict societies. 

Obviously the main reason for this prevailing deficit is that priorities are generally on 
immediate post-crisis stabilisation. Issues related to the rule of law, to police reform, the 
sustainable size of forces, etc., have often been seen as later priorities, to be tackled after the 
immediate tasks of stabilisation have been achieved, and thus outside of the realm of DDR. In 
addition, DDR policy-makers and implementers are justifiably concerned with an overload of the 
DDR agenda. It is already a tough job to implement programmes of the desired scale and quality.  

Still, it would be foolish to ignore the important links between DDR and SSR. This is 
clearly seen in the importance of reintegration success on criminality, but not yet as clear for 
DDR as influencing security sector reconstruction and reform. It is a good sign that views are 
changing, in post-conflict countries, among development donors, and in the international 
community at large. Security issues, including the build-up and democratic control over domestic 
security forces, are increasingly seen as integrated with the overall reconstruction effort. The 
traditional separation between civilian and military elements in reconstruction is slowly giving 
way to better coordination and cooperation. However, this is a slow and tortuous process, full of 
sensitivities among actors involved and contradictory outcomes.  

To sum up, decisionmaking on DDR in peace agreements or early on in post-war situations 
is related to some elements central for SSR, particularly the size and composition of forces, but 
also the funding needs of security sectors, and the roles and objectives of the various institutions 
of the security sector. These decisions are generally made in negotiations among former warring 
partners and with major players in the international community, including those willing to fund 
post-war security sectors. They therefore tend to be shaped by the interests of the leaders of 
warring groups and major international actors. Main concerns are post-war stabilisation, but also 
costs and protection of the interests of the leader of former warring groups and their combatants, 
while physical security of people and SSR issues were, at least in the past, only rarely of 
importance.  
 
 
Lessons from Post-Conflict DDR 
 
If the above argument holds, DDR designs should not only follow the logic of preventing the 
recurrence of armed conflict but also more broadly take account of the effects of DDR 
programmes on post-war human security, including the way in which parameters are set for SSR. 
What would this mean in practice? DDR practitioners, academics, representatives of international 
organisations and particularly development donors have increasingly found decisionmaking over 
DDR, as described above, deficient. Several ways to address this have been suggested, and will 
be discussed below, namely to put SSR first, to broaden the scope of security sector governance 
and to better coordinate SSR and DDR planning on the ground. 
 
 
Security Sector Reform First? 
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Obviously, it would be more logical to have a broad security assessment and an SSR planning 
process first – involving a wide spectrum of actors concerned with and affected by security 
provision – and DDR as one of the instruments of SSR. In an ideal situation, future threat 
analysis, development of a strategic policy framework, specific plans for security institutions, 
etc., should precede decisions about the level of personnel security forces should have, and how 
many soldiers and who should be demobilised and offered reintegration support.  

Such planning, however, is generally out of the question in immediate post-war situations. 
Peacebuilding, including promoting trust among former warring parties, the reduction of the costs 
of armed formations, and giving former combatants a new, civilian perspective, are the priorities, 
and rightly so. Still, at least some SSR concerns should be included in peace negotiations and in 
immediate post-war situations. In particular, decisions taken should not be set in stone. Flexibility 
is also advocated in a recent practical field and classroom guide on DDR.xviii It also seems to be 
the path taken by an expert group within the Stockholm Initiative on DDR.xix  

In cases where the international community has a strong and direct stake in post-conflict 
situations, international organisations seem to have the potential to implement joint DDR and 
SSR strategies. In post-2003 Liberia, for instance, the UN is central for both SSR and DDR 
efforts, though it can be questioned to which extent these efforts are really joint. The tools are 
available. A recent report on the advances in reforming peacekeeping by the UN Secretary 
General contains the following: 
 

The major strategic challenge in the year ahead for our approach to disarmament, 
demobilisation and reintegration is the need to develop workable arrangements for 
United Nations system-wide coordination of disarmament, demobilisation and 
reintegration policy and strategy development. That would also provide 
opportunities for other entities, including the Bretton Woods institutions, Member 
States and NGOs, to contribute to disarmament, demobilisation and reintegration 
planning and implementation processes. Recent experience in post-conflict 
societies has demonstrated that sustainable peace cannot be built in the absence of 
the rule of law and United Nations peacekeeping operations continue to expend 
efforts and resources on restoration of the rule of law.xx 

 
The World Bank, which has been a major actor in reintegration, has used several instruments to 
prevent its funding from inadvertently being used for force modernisation. In the Ugandan case, 
for instance, the international donor community set a limit on military expenditures. The Ugandan 
government was told, beginning in the late 1990s, that it would lose development assistance if the 
share of military spending in the gross national product would rise above 2 percent. Spending 
caps, however, have proven to be highly problematic. In Uganda it has, for instance, led to 
‘creative budgeting’ and a decrease in transparency in military expenditures.  

The World Bank now seems to favour commitments for SSR from governments receiving 
DDR funding. One example is the Multi-Donor Recovery Program (MDRP), the largest post-
conflict DDR programme currently running, planning the demobilisation of 455,300 ex-
combatants in the African Great Lakes area. The World Bank, which leads the MDRP, has on its 
website lists of ‘What the MDRP Is’ and ‘What the MDRP Is Not’. First among the former is: 
‘An initiative aimed at improving stability and socio-economic development in the greater Great 
Lakes region of Africa’. Among the latter is ‘A security sector reform program’.xxi If that is so, 
how has the World Bank arrived at the numbers of ex-combatants to be demobilised, and, in 
consequence, to be kept in armed forces of countries in the African Great Lake area? In a paper 
from the MDRP program discussing these issues it is said that ‘[i]n order to be eligible for 
funding under the MDRP, the Governments concerned are expected to submit a letter of 
demobilisation policy that should expand on links with security sector reform, including plans for 
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future military size and budget, military unification and restructuring where relevant’.xxii In the 
demobilisation programme for Angola, the ADRP, the World Bank has attached a number of 
conditions on funding, including ‘further clarity concerning the Government’s plans for the 
security sector’ and ‘a net reduction in the size of the FAA (Armed Forces of Angola)’. It 
required the government to prepare and sign a letter of demobilisation policy outlining 
government commitments, including ‘to the regional peace process, demobilisation and 
reintegration, security sector reform and fiscal impact of demobilisation’.xxiii These are beginnings 
in a process of greater integration of SSR and DDR programmes, but not more. For the MDRP, 
for instance, follow-up to letters by governments stating their SSR intentions has been very 
limited: ‘However, once such letters are submitted, there have been very few, if any, formal or 
informal exchanges between partners on the subject of SSR.’xxiv With no follow-up it is not clear 
what value such arrangements have in reality. They are commitments made in certain situations. 
Circumstances can easily change. Moreover, it is not clear from the World Bank documents 
whether there are any requirements on the process of deciding on these commitments. In addition, 
SSR policies drawn up by governments, without consultation of stakeholders, and no democratic 
decisionmaking process, are not passing the basic test of security sector governance.xxv 
 
Broadening the Scope of Security Sector Governance 
 
Another and potentially complementary approach to bringing SSR thinking into decisions on 
DDR is to widen the circle of decisionmakers, and include a broader set of stakeholders in the 
provision of security. The broadening of participation in peace negotiations has been argued for 
from several angles. Most prominent is the inclusion of women, which has been endorsed by the 
UN Security Council in SCR 1325, but good arguments have been made for broad, and 
representative, inclusion of stakeholders in peace negotiations and post-war situations. This is 
obviously also true for decisions about the scope and structure of DDR programmes.  

Such representation comes close to the emphasis in the literature on SSR in democratic 
control and governance. Of course, even very representative decisionmaking bodies may not 
come up with the right solutions with respect to DDR and SSR, but the likelihood that decisions 
are not made in the interests of particular groups of powerful leaders is lowered. 

In a nutshell, the way forward in making the links between DDR and SSR stronger in post-
conflict situations is security sector governance, and at least some international actors now seem 
to promote this approach. Obviously, neither full-blown security sector reform planning, nor a 
set-up of balanced security sector governance institutions is realistic in post-war situations. But 
what is realistic is to include a broad range of stakeholders in peace negotiations and immediate 
post-war decision making and to bring SSR issues to bear, including in decisions on DDR.xxvi 
 
Removing Obstacles to Better Coordination 
 
The argument for better coordination and decisionmaking in security sector governance 
institutions is rather straightforward. Still, limited information available both about post-conflict 
situations as well as major downsizing in the wake of streamlining and modernisation of armed 
forces indicates that it is often lacking. If so, what are the reasons?  

Currently one can only speculate on an answer. One possible reason is that interests of both 
military and civilian actors in pursuing their priorities are often too strong to allow for better 
coordination, which may come at the cost of the pursuit of partial interests. Another possible 
reason is that the importance of coordination of SSR and DDR is too small to lead to the 
establishment of proper bodies for coordination. A third possible reason is that security sector 
governance institutions are often lacking or weak, so that it would be unrealistic to expect them to 
take on the role of coordinating DDR and SSR processes.  
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As mentioned above, the facts about the links between SSR and DDR, and the lack of 
coordination between the two processes are not well established and are partially speculative. 
DDR practitioners are often overwhelmed by the various demands on DDR programmes and 
warn of overloading DDR programmes. However, increasingly, it is argued that the political 
nature of DDR programmes cannot be ignored and their broad security implications beyond 
immediate peacebuilding have to be considered, including on post-war human security. Still, 
rather little research has so far been done on the security conditions and security implications of 
DDR. Most of the limited research on DDR focuses on practical matters, or on effects on 
peacebuilding.xxvii Research on its implications for individual security, particularly crime rates 
and crime prevention, is scarce, despite the often made assumptions about the effects of failed 
reintegration on crime. SSR is even less well researched, partly because of the novelty of this 
concept, which remains contentious in both its content and usefulness. More research would 
therefore seem important before more definitive answers can be given as to how important the 
lack of coordination between SSR and DDR actually is, how the interests of various types of 
actors in such coordination can be overcome and what kind of security sector governance 
institutions are best suited to deal with these problems. 
 
 
Conclusion and Policy Recommendations 
 
The main arguments made in this chapter were that: (1) there are several important links between 
SSR and DDR; (2) these can be detrimental to both the success of SSR and DDR but also be used 
to improve, through better coordination, the success of both SSR and DDR; and (3) institutions of 
security sector governance are the best place for such coordination. 

The most important link is that between DDR and SSR in post-conflict situations. DDR 
influences the conditions for SSR both on the supply side – by setting initial force sizes and 
selection between who is to be demobilised and who not – and on the demand side – by affecting 
the security situation, particularly with respect to crime and the likelihood of resurgence of armed 
conflict. In theory, it would be preferable to let an SSR process precede DDR. However, this 
often is not possible because of the pressing need to downsize armed forces, as an element in 
peacebuilding as well as for financial reasons. In addition, there are often clashes of interest, 
particularly between national military decisionmakers, who want to prioritise SSR and see DDR 
as a kind ‘mopping up’ of those parts of the former military sector not seen as needed for the new 
military, and some civilian actors, often including external development donors, who want to 
prioritise demilitarisation. These actors tend to see the modernisation of armed forces as counter 
to the objectives of DDR processes. In such a constellation of interests, institutions of security 
sector governance, which bring these various interests together in a deliberative process that ends 
with democratic decisionmaking, are of great importance. Currently, there generally is a lack of 
such security sector governance institutions, sometimes leading to misunderstandings about the 
objectives and practical implementation of DDR and SSR processes. 

Lack of policy coordination in post-war reconstruction is not specific to SSR and DDR, but 
a rather general phenomenon. Efforts at better integration can therefore benefit from general 
progress in the area of policy coordination, which is currently a subject of much debate in the 
development donor community.xxviii Based on the above discussion three recommendations seem 
to be of particular importance for improving coordination.  

The first recommendation is to raise awareness of the effects of the design and 
implementation of DDR programmes on the provision of security beyond the immediate interest 
of satisfying the demands of parties to a peace agreement. Some of the links are broadly accepted, 
such as the one between reintegration success and post-war criminality. Others, however, are 
often overlooked, particularly the ways in which decisions on DDR programmes set parameters 
for security sector reconstruction and reform. Part of this awareness-raising effort needs to be 
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more research into the links between DDR and SSR. Recent studies on human security in local 
settings seem to provide a particularly useful avenue for such research.xxix 

The second recommendation is to broaden decisionmaking on DDR in view of the 
recognition of the effects of DDR beyond immediate post-war confidence-building. This should 
occur within the framework of a general expansion of decisionmaking on security issues in post-
war situations. There is no reason to create specific governance institutions to deal with the links 
between DDR and wider security considerations. Rather it would seem possible that this first be 
done in the forum where peace is negotiated, to be followed later on by more permanent 
institutions that allow the relevant stakeholders voice and influence.  

A third recommendation is for the international community to broaden its perspective on 
DDR. There are major institutional obstacles already in the current situation, with design and 
implementation of DDR programmes generally marked by a multitude of actors with differing 
interests and mandates. Current efforts to achieve greater consistency, such as the Stockholm 
Initiative, as well as ‘learning by doing’, for instance in the MDRP programme, are welcome 
improvements. However, more policy discussion, as well as the coordination of implementation, 
will need to be done to better address the full complexity of DDR programmes, including their 
effect on security sector reform. 
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